
The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm

Understanding the true impact of The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm presents a rich tapestry of
knowledge that adds a new dimension to academic discourse. This paper, through its detailed formulation,
presents not only meaningful interpretations, but also stimulates scholarly dialogue. By targeting pressing
issues, The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm functions as a pivotal reference for future research.

Educational papers like The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm are essential for students, researchers, and
professionals. Having access to high-quality papers is now easier than ever with our comprehensive
collection of PDF papers.

The Lasting Legacy of The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm

The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm creates a legacy that resonates with individuals long after the final
page. It is a creation that goes beyond its moment, providing universal truths that forever inspire and
captivate generations to come. The effect of the book is evident not only in its messages but also in the
methods it influences thoughts. The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm is a reflection to the strength of
narrative to transform the way we see the world.

Conclusion of The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm

In conclusion, The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm presents a concise overview of the research process
and the findings derived from it. The paper addresses important topics within the field and offers valuable
insights into emerging patterns. By drawing on sound data and methodology, the authors have offered
evidence that can shape both future research and practical applications. The paper’s conclusions highlight the
importance of continuing to explore this area in order to gain a deeper understanding. Overall, The Fairy Tale
Detectives (Sisters Grimm is an important contribution to the field that can serve as a foundation for future
studies and inspire ongoing dialogue on the subject.

Methodology Used in The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm

In terms of methodology, The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm employs a comprehensive approach to
gather data and evaluate the information. The authors use qualitative techniques, relying on surveys to collect
data from a target group. The methodology section is designed to provide transparency regarding the research
process, ensuring that readers can understand the steps taken to gather and analyze the data. This approach
ensures that the results of the research are valid and based on a sound scientific method. The paper also
discusses the strengths and limitations of the methodology, offering critical insights on the effectiveness of
the chosen approach in addressing the research questions. In addition, the methodology is framed to ensure
that any future research in this area can build upon the current work.

Need a reference for maintenance The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm ? The official documentation
ensures you understand the full process, providing clear solutions.

Knowing the right steps is key to efficient usage. The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm offers all the
necessary details, available in a professionally structured document for quick access.

Avoid lengthy searches to The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm without delays. We provide a research
paper in digital format.

Deepen your knowledge with The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm , now available in a simple,
accessible file. This book provides in-depth insights that you will not want to miss.



Having access to the right documentation makes all the difference. That’s why The Fairy Tale Detectives
(Sisters Grimm is available in an optimized digital file, allowing quick referencing. Access it instantly.

Another noteworthy section within The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm is its coverage on performance
settings. Here, users are introduced to pro-level configurations that improve efficiency. These are often
absent in shallow guides, but The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm explains them with user-friendly
language. Readers can personalize workflows based on real needs, which makes the tool or product feel truly
flexible.

The Sisters Grimm: The Unusual Suspects - #2

Ferryport Landing is having a monster problem, and the sisters Grimm try to solve it.

The Council of Mirrors (Sisters Grimm #9)

The thrilling conclusion to the beloved New York Times bestselling Sisters Grimm series! Grany Relda’s
body has been hijacked by the Master, and it’s up to Sabrina, Daphne, and the rest of the Grimms to fight for
her freedom and that of Ferryport Landing in the series’s grand finale. As war rips the town apart, Sabrina
consults a team of magic mirrors, who prophesize that the only way the good guys will win is if she leads the
army herself. Now, Sabrina controls the fate of all the Everafters, the very people who have made her life so
difficult since she and Daphne arrived in Ferryport Landing. Will they listen to a Grimm? And can she really
save them? Repackaged in paperback with new cover art, these anniversary editions of the beloved Sisters
Grimm series are the perfect opportunity for existing fans to revisit the adventures of the Grimm family and
for new readers to discover the magic of the series for the first time.

The Sisters Grimm: Fairy-Tale Detectives

First in the New York Times–bestselling series! “A world in which humans and fairy-tale creatures live side-
by-side . . . Madcap adventure.” —School Library Journal Orphaned sisters Sabrina and Daphne are sent to
live with their newly discovered grandmother, Relda Grimm, in the strange town of Ferryport Landing. The
girls soon learn a family secret: that they are descendants of the famous Brothers Grimm, whose book of
fairy tales is actually a history book and whose characters are still alive in Ferryport, New York. When a
terrorizing giant goes on a rampage through the town, it’s up to the Sisters Grimm to stop him and to solve
the mystery of who set the giant loose in the first place. Was it corrupt Mayor Charming, formerly Prince
Charming, who desperately wants his kingdom back? The Three Not-So-Little Pigs, the shifty town cops? Or
Snow White or Jack the Giant Killer or one of the many other fairy-tale characters who seem to have it out
for the young sisters Grimms? Fast paced, with familiar characters in new surroundings and adventure, and
cleverly inserted vocabulary lessons, this book, and this series, are special for young readers. This
anniversary edition of the beloved Sisters Grimm series is the perfect opportunity for existing fans to revisit
the adventures of the Grimm family and for new readers to discover the magic of the series for the first time.
“Kids will love Sabrina and Daphne’s adventures as much as I did.” —Sarah Michelle Gellar, star of Buffy
the Vampire Slayer “Adventure, laughs, and surprises kept me eagerly turning the pages.” —R. L. Stine,
New York Times–bestselling author of the Goosebumps series

The Everafter War

The Everafter War

Once Upon a Crime

When the fairy-tale detectives rush to New York City to find an Everafter who can cure Puck, they trigger a
The Fairy Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm



chain of events that includes a murder mystery, and learn many new things about their mother, who is in an
enchanted sleep.

The Inside Story (Sisters Grimm #8)

The fate of all fairy tales is at stake in the eighth adventure in the beloved New York Times bestselling
Sisters Grimm series Sabrina and Daphne Grimm have studied hundreds of stories as part of their training as
fairy-tale detectives, but they never thought they’d actually be in one. And yet that’s exactly what happens
when they follow the diabolical Master into the Book of Everafter, a mysterious tome in which copies of the
world’s fairy-tale characters live out their stories over and over again. The Grimms must track down the
Master while avoiding the Book’s tyrannical Editor—who is devoted to keeping the stories on track—and his
army of story-gobbling revisers. In the Book of Everafter, stories can be rewritten and destinies changed,
which is why Sabrina and Daphne must find the Master before he can alter his own fate—and the fate of the
whole world.

Problem Child (The Sisters Grimm #3)

With the help of a long lost relative, and a little magic, Sabrina Grimm and her sister Daphne try to find out
who has kidnapped their parents and rescue them.

Magic and Other Misdemeanors

When the past and future start mixing with the present, Sabrina and Daphne have their first case to tackle
solo-with a little help from the troublemaker Puck. Can Sabrina and Daphne solve the crime and change the
future for the better?

The Fairy-Tale Detectives (Sisters Grimm #1)

Enter a world of fractured fairy tales and magical mysteries in this first installment of the beloved New York
Times bestselling Sisters Grimm series Orphaned sisters Sabrina and Daphne are sent to live with their newly
discovered grandmother, Relda Grimm, in the strange town of Ferryport Landing. The girls soon learn a
family secret: that they are descendants of the famous Brothers Grimm, whose book of fairy tales is actually
a history book. When a terrorizing giant goes on a rampage through the town, it’s up to the Sisters Grimm to
stop him and to solve the mystery of who set the giant loose in the first place. Was it Mayor Charming,
formerly Prince Charming, who desperately wants his kingdom back? The Three Not-So-Little Pigs, the
shifty town cops? Or one of the many other fairy-tale characters who seem to have it out for the Grimms?
Repackaged in paperback with new cover art, these anniversary editions of the beloved Sisters Grimm series
are the perfect opportunity for existing fans to revisit the adventures of the Grimm family and for new readers
to discover the magic of the series for the first time.

Tales from the Hood (Sisters Grimm #6)

The Big Bad Wolf is on trial, and it’s up to the Sisters Grimm to prove his innocence in the sixth adventure in
the beloved New York Times bestselling fantasy series In Ferryport Landing, everyone gets their day in
court—even the Big Bad Wolf. Mr. Canis is put on trial for past crimes, and Mayor Heart’s kangaroo court is
sure to find him guilty. It’s up to the Grimms to uncover evidence to save their friend, though Sabrina starts
to wonder whether they would all be safer with the Wolf in jail. Despite her misgivings, Sabrina and her
sister, Daphne, investigate what really happened in the Big Bad Wolf’s most famous tale—and the real story
might bring long-awaited justice for more than just Mr. Canis! Repackaged in paperback with new cover art,
these anniversary editions of the beloved Sisters Grimm series are the perfect opportunity for existing fans to
revisit the adventures of the Grimm family and for new readers to discover the magic of the series for the first
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time.

The Everafter War (Sisters Grimm #7)

Picking up after the dramatic cliffhanger that ended Book Six, Sabrina and Daphne’s prayers are finally
answered when their parents awake from their sleeping spell. But their happy reunion is short-lived, as they
are caught in the middle of a war between the Scarlet Hand and Prince Charming’s Everafter army. As the
family works to help the prince’s ragtag group of rebels and protect their friends, Sabrina comes face-to-face
with the family’s deadliest enemy—the mysterious Master—who reveals a secret so shocking it will rock the
entire family to its core. F&P level: U

Suffrage Sisters

Elizabeth Cady Stanton spoke before an eager crowd in Seneca Falls, New York, on a hot July morning in
1948. She began her speech with words that were familiar to American ears: But the ideas that followed were
radical. \"We hold these truths to be self-evident that all men and women are created equal\" Stanton went on
to boldly demand equal rights for women--including suffrage, the right to vote. It took more than 70 years
from that moment before all American women could vote in American elections. The fight was led by several
generations of courageous women who devoted their lives to liberty and equality. This is their story.

Finn and the Intergalactic Lunchbox

From the New York Times bestselling author of the Sisters Grimm and NERDS comes a new action-packed
middle-grade series with aliens, robots, and kids saving the world! Finn Foley has a lunchbox, and when he
opens it, weird things come out . . . like a seven-foot-tall robot and a strange, blinking device that glues itself
to his chest. The lunchbox also opens wormholes--shortcuts through space--that take Finn to the farthest
corners of the galaxy. Sounds awesome, right? Not so much. Rocketing through the cosmos attracts the
attention of the Plague, a race of gigantic bugs. The thing on Finn's chest belongs to them--it's the most
dangerous weapon in the universe--and they want it back. To fight the Plague, Finn will need the lunchbox,
as well as an unlikely squad: Lincoln, the bully; Julep, the coolest girl in school; Kate, Finn's unicorn-
obsessed little sister; and Highbeam, a robot spy from another galaxy. If they can learn to work together, they
just might have a chance, but the bugs are coming, and they'll stop at nothing to get their weapon--even if it
means destroying the world.

Tales from the Brothers Grimm

A gorgeous collection of familiar and lesser-known Grimm tales, illustrated by one of the greatest children’s
illustrators of our time This handsome edition from the well-known collection of fairy tales by the Brothers
Grimm contains 11 popular stories. Old favorites such as “Hansel and Gretel” and “The Bremen Town
Musicians” are included as are some lesser-known stories such as “The Seven Ravens” and “Hans My
Hedgehog.” Lisbeth Zwerger’s evocative and exquisite illustrations perfectly capture the mood of these
enduring tales.

Foghorn Flattery and the Dancing Horses

When a Vienna show horse is stolen, the Flattery siblings will stop at nothing to find the steed and solve the
case C.C. and Foghorn Flattery love traveling around the world with their dad for his freelance writing
assignments. Their latest stop is Vienna—a city of beauty, culture, and of course, the Spanish Riding School.
C.C. can’t wait to see the famous dancing horses, but when they get to the school, they discover that one of
the stallions has been stolen! It’s up to Foghorn and C.C. to track down the missing horse and return him to
his rightful owners. But to do so, they’ll have to escape a circus, hide out in a spooky castle, and outsmart the
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thieves before it’s too late!

Cracked

Trevor, Nick and Robyn are ready to solve another mystery. When bobsledder Josh Gantz is accused of
deliberately injuring a fellow competitor, he runs the risk of being thrown out of the sport—right before the
World Cup. Courtney Gantz asks Trevor, Nick and Robyn to help clear her brother's name. Can they find out
who framed Josh? What is the meaning of the strange coded messages they keep finding around Olympic
Park? Who eats orange bananas, anyway? The kids must unearth the clues in a race against time, before
Josh's championship dreams end up on ice. This short novel is a high-interest, low-reading level book for
middle-grade readers who are building reading skills, want a quick read or say they don’t like to read! The
epub edition of this title is fully accessible.

Girl's Best Friend

Nancy Drew fans will fall for the first title in Leslie Margolis's pitch-perfect middle-grade series, The Maggie
Brooklyn Mysteries. Dogs are disappearing in her neighborhood, and Maggie Brooklyn Sinclair knows all
about it. After all, she has a semi-secret after-school gig as a professional (ok, amateur) dog-walker. Maggie
hates to see a pup in trouble, so she's even willing to help her ex-best friend Ivy recover her rescue-dog,
Kermit. Kermit's being held for ransom, and Maggie has noticed some suspicious behavior lately. But she
never suspected her crush Milo could be involved . . . Don't miss these other stories by Leslie Margolis: The
Maggie Brooklyn Mysteries Girl's Best Friend Vanishing Acts Secrets at the Chocolate Mansion The
Annabelle Unleashed series Boys Are Dogs Girls Acting Catty Everybody Bugs Out One Tough Chick
Monkey Business

Reynard the Fox and Other Fables

A collection of eighteen fables as told by Jean de La Fontaine, including \"The Tortoise Who Ran a Race
with the Hare\" and \"The Grapes Hang High for Reynard the Fox.\"

Finn and the Subatomic Slip-and-Slide

From the New York Times bestselling author of the Sisters Grimm and NERDS comes the third and final
book in the time-jumping, universe-skipping, action-packed middle grade series with equal parts humor and
heart! After his adventures through time, Finn returns home to a world he doesn’t recognize. Changing the
past has created an all-new present, one in which he and his friends never vanquished the Plague. Now the
giant bugs rule Earth from their spaceship! What’s an intergalactic traveler to do? The answer is obvious.
Finn, Lincoln and Julep must defeat the Plague. Again. But how? Julep and Lincoln don’t remember Finn or
their friendships. In fact, they’ve changed just as much as the world itself has, and they want nothing to do
with his dangerous plan to save humankind. Finn’s plan? Find his father, Asher Foley, who is trapped on a
microscopic world known as the Subatomic. Using a space-age slip-and-slide, Finn and his confused former-
friends shrink themselves to enter this strange new world where nothing is as it seems, hoping to find his
father, the one man who can put history, and the present, back together. It won’t be easy. The Subatomic is
ruled by an evil menace with an army of hulking robots under his command. Even worse, Finn’s bitterest
enemy, the Plague soldier Sin Kraven, is in pursuit. Can Finn find his father, save his friendships, and return
to Earth in time to stop the Plague? \"Rousingly raucous.\"--Kirkus Reviews

A Tale Dark & Grimm

In this mischievous and utterly original debut, Hansel and Gretel walk out of their own story and into eight
other classic Grimm-inspired tales. As readers follow the siblings through a forest brimming with menacing
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foes, they learn the true story behind (and beyond) the bread crumbs, edible houses, and outwitted witches.
Fairy tales have never been more irreverent or subversive as Hansel and Gretel learn to take charge of their
destinies and become the clever architects of their own happily ever after.

The Scandalous Sisterhood of Prickwillow Place

There's a murderer on the loose—but that doesn't stop the girls of St. Etheldreda's from attempting to hide the
death of their headmistress in this rollicking farce. The students of St. Etheldreda's School for Girls face a
bothersome dilemma. Their irascible headmistress, Mrs. Plackett, and her surly brother, Mr. Godding, have
been most inconveniently poisoned at Sunday dinner. Now the school will almost certainly be closed and the
girls sent home—unless these seven very proper young ladies can hide the murders and convince their
neighbors that nothing is wrong. Julie Berry's The Scandalous Sisterhood of Prickwillow Place is a smart,
hilarious Victorian romp, full of outrageous plot twists, mistaken identities, and mysterious happenings.

Finn and the Time-Traveling Pajamas

From the New York Times bestselling author of the Sisters Grimm and NERDS comes the second book in an
action-packed middle grade series with equal parts humor and heart! When Finn is saved from the Time
Rangers by an older version of himself, it comes with a catch. Old Man Finn needs Finn and his friends,
Lincoln and Julep, to help him win battles he lost years ago against the Paradox, a terrible creatures obsessed
with revenge against Finn's father. If they succeed, he promises to tell Finn where his father is. He even gives
them a pair of time-traveling pajamas to help them with their quest. There's only one problem. The pajamas
malfunction almost immediately. Along the way the kids avoid being eaten by sabretooths, shot by
revolutionary war soldiers, and start a war with a town full of holograms, all in an effort to fix the jammies.
Just when their goal is in sight, Julep gets sick. Only...it doesn't seem like she's sick. It seems like she's
changing. The adventure may cost Finn more than an old pair of pajamas--it may cost him his friends!

The Sisters Grimm

The critically acclaimed author of The House at the End of Hope Street combines love, mystery, and magic
with her first foray into bewitching fantasy with a dark edge evocative of V.E. Schwab and Neil Gaiman.
Once upon a time, a demon who desired earthly domination fathered an army of dark daughters to help him
corrupt humanity . . . As children, Goldie, Liyana, Scarlet, and Bea dreamed of a strange otherworld: a
nightscape of mists and fog, perpetually falling leaves and hungry ivy, lit by an unwavering moon. Here, in
this shadowland of Everwhere, the four girls, half-sisters connected by blood and magic, began to nurture
their elemental powers together. But at thirteen, the sisters were ripped from Everwhere and separated. Now,
five years later, they search for one another and yearn to rediscover their unique and supernatural strengths.
Goldie (earth) manipulates plants and gives life. Liyana (water) controls rivers and rain. Scarlet (fire) has
electricity at her fingertips. Bea (air) can fly. To realize their full potential, the blood sisters must return to the
land of their childhood dreams. But Everwhere can only be accessed through certain gates at 3:33 A.M. on
the night of a new moon. As Goldie, Liyana, Scarlet, and Bea are beset with the challenges of their earthly
lives, they must prepare for a battle that lies ahead. On their eighteenth birthday, they will be subjected to a
gladiatorial fight with their father’s soldiers. If they survive, they will face their father who will let them live
only if they turn dark. Which would be fair, if only the sisters knew what was coming. So, they have thirty-
three days to discover who they truly are and what they can truly do, before they must fight to save
themselves and those they love.

My BFF Is an Alien

Meet Abriana Yeo, 13, awkward and friendless. Meet Octavia Wu, a graceful teenage alien with
superpowers. Forced to flee her home planet Viridis after an invasion by \"The Others\
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The Words in My Hands

Part coming of age, part call to action, this fast-paced #ownvoices novel about a Deaf teenager is a unique
and inspiring exploration of what it means to belong. Smart, artistic, and independent, sixteen year old Piper
is tired of trying to conform. Her mom wants her to be “normal,” to pass as hearing, to get a good job. But in
a time of food scarcity, environmental collapse, and political corruption, Piper has other things on her
mind—like survival. Piper has always been told that she needs to compensate for her Deafness in a world
made for those who can hear. But when she meets Marley, a new world opens up—one where Deafness is
something to celebrate, and where resilience means taking action, building a com-munity, and believing in
something better. Published to rave reviews as Future Girl in Australia (Allen & Unwin, Sept. 2020), this
empowering, unforgettable story is told through a visual extravaganza of text, paint, collage, and drawings.
Set in an ominously prescient near future, The Words in My Hands is very much a novel for our turbulent
times.

Dying to Meet You

In this story told mostly through letters, children's book author, I.B. Grumply, gets more than he bargained
for when he rents a quiet place to write for the summer.

Wished

The fifth installment in the beloved Fairy Tale Reform School series where the teachers are (former) villains
Be careful what you wish for... With big-time villains Rumpelstiltskin and Alva still on the loose and the
citizens of Enchantasia on high alert, things at Fairy Tale Reform School have been a little...stressed. So
when Maxine finds an old lamp that turns out to house an overly-enthusiastic genie, she knows exactly what
to do; wish for everyone to be happy! But the wish has some unexpected consequences...suddenly, ex-villains
are singing, trolls and ogres are getting along, and the whole school is more focused on putting on a musical
than figuring out how to deal with Rumpelstiltskin. Can Gilly help Maxine break the spell before it's too late?
This series is perfect for read-alongs between parents and kids and engaging reluctant readers.

Grimms' Fairy Tales

Since 2005, Michael Buckley's bestselling Sisters Grimm series has delighted fans with the story of the
Grimm family, guardians of the world's fairy-tale characters. There's only one book left in the series, and this
comprehensive guide provides the perfect refresher for fans looking to brush up before the dramatic final
installment and is the perfect introduction for new readers. Featuring character profiles, maps of the town,
found objects from life in Ferryport Landing, fairy-tale \"facts,\" and much more, this artfully designed guide
supplements and enhances the beloved series. Even fan favorite Puck weighs in with his cheeky alternate
take on all things Grimm. Praise for The Sisters Grimm: A Very Grimm Guide \"Visually, the guide is
stunning and showcases intriguing side characters.\" -VOYA

A Very Grimm Guide

A choose-your-own-ending tale of a distinguished lobster and a fateful dinner party When invited to a fancy
dinner party, Lenny brings thoughtful gifts for the hosts and enthusiasm for whatever's in store. But when
he's greeted with a pot of boiling water and lobster bibs, Lenny [and readers] must quickly decide: should he
stay or go? This laugh-out-loud text by bestselling author Michael Buckley and his 10-year-old son Finn is
stunningly accompanied by illustrations that demonstrate Catherine Meurisse's flare for the dramatic. Ages 4-
7

Lenny the Lobster Can't Stay for Dinner
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For Sabrina and Daphne Grimm, life hasn't been a fairytale. After the mysterious disappearance of their
parents, the sisters are sent to live with their grandmother - a woman they believed was dead! Granny Relda
reveals that the girls have two famous ancestors, the Brothers Grimm, whose classic book of fairytales is
actually a history book that documents magical mischief. Now the girls must take on the family responsibility
of being fairytale detectives. Their first case? A roller-coaster ride of an adventure to stop a giant from
destroying their new home town.

The Fairytale Detectives

The fairy-tale detectives set out to rescue their parents in the third book of the beloved New York Times
bestselling Sisters Grimm series For Sabrina and Daphne Grimm, the latest in a long line of fairy-tale
detectives, there is one mystery they want to solve above all others: Who kidnapped their parents? Sabrina
finds the secret hideaway of the Scarlet Hand, the sinister group of Everafters who are holding her parents
captive, and she has a chance to rescue their mom and dad. But her plan is foiled by the most famous fairy-
tale character in the world. How can a human child defeat a magic one? With the help of her little sister (who
is a lot tougher than Sabrina realizes) and a long-lost relative, Sabrina finds a powerful weapon . . . but
discovers that magic comes at a high price. Repackaged in paperback with new cover art, these anniversary
editions of the beloved Sisters Grimm series are the perfect opportunity for existing fans to revisit the
adventures of the Grimm family and for new readers to discover the magic of the series for the first time.

The Problem Child (Sisters Grimm #3)

The fairy-tale detectives must fight magic with magic to rescue their parents in the third book of the New
York Times–bestselling children’s series. For Sabrina and Daphne Grimm, the latest in a long line of fairy-
tale detectives, there is one mystery they want to solve above all others: Who kidnapped their parents? When
Sabrina finds the secret hideaway of the Scarlet Hand, the sinister group of Everafters who are holding her
parents captive, she finally has a chance to rescue their mom and dad. But to do it, she must defeat the most
famous fairy-tale character in the world. With the help of her little sister (who is a lot tougher than Sabrina
realizes) and a long-lost relative, Sabrina finds a powerful weapon...but discovers that magic comes at a high
price. Reissued with new cover art, these anniversary editions of the beloved Sisters Grimm series are the
perfect opportunity for old fans to revisit the Grimm family’s adventures and for new readers to discover the
magic of the series.

The Fairy-tale Detectives

For use in schools and libraries only. In the land of Everafters, there is no shortage of mysteries for Daphne
and Saprina Grimm, the latest in a long line of fairy-tale detectives.

The Sisters Grimm: The Problem Child

A diabolical character is out to rewrite the fate of all fairytales in the eighth adventure in the New York
Times–bestselling children’s series. Sabrina and Daphne Grimm have studied hundreds of stories as part of
their training as fairy-tale detectives. But they’re about to get caught up in the action when they follow the
scheming Master into the Book of Everafter. Inside this mysterious tome, copies of the world’s fairytale
characters live out their stories over and over again. The Grimms must track down the Master while avoiding
the Book’s tyrannical Editor—who is devoted to keeping the stories on track—and his army of story-
gobbling revisers. In the Book of Everafter, stories can be rewritten and destinies changed, which is why
Sabrina and Daphne must find the Master before he can alter his own fate—and the fate of the whole world.
Reissued with new cover art, these anniversary editions of the beloved Sisters Grimm series are the perfect
opportunity for old fans to revisit the Grimm family’s adventures and for new readers to discover the magic
of the series.
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The Fairy-Tale Detectives

Orphans Sabrina and Daphne Grimm are sent to live with an eccentric grandmother that they have always
believed to be dead.

The Sisters Grimm: The Inside Story

As the fairytale detectives race through the Book of Everafter searching for their baby brother, they
encounter various characters including the Editor and his army of Revisers, who threaten the children with
dire consequences if they continue to cha

The Sisters Grimm, Book One

A mystery at school leads two fairy-tale detectives to face deadly monsters in the second book of this New
York Times–bestselling children’s series. For Sabrina Grimm, living in a community of fairy-tale characters
means always being ready for trouble. And something is definitely wrong at her new school. The adults seem
too angry, the kids seem too mean, and the gym teacher likes dodgeball way too much. But when Sabrina’s
teacher is found dead, dangling in a giant spiderweb, it becomes clear that Ferryport Landing Elementary has
a monster problem. Can the Sisters Grimm get to the bottom of this sticky situation? Reissued with new
cover art, these anniversary editions of the beloved Sisters Grimm series are the perfect opportunity for old
fans to revisit the Grimm family’s adventures and for new readers to discover the magic of the series.

The Inside Story

Fairy-tale characters take over New York City in the fourth installment of the beloved New York Times
bestselling Sisters Grimm series For the first time since their parents were kidnapped, Sabrina and Daphne
Grimm return to their hometown, New York City, to find Puck’s family. But the fairy-tale detectives get
more than they bargained for in the Big Apple: wand-wielding fairy godfathers, swashbuckling Wall Street
pirates, subway-stealing dwarfs, and—worst of all—hidden among these urban Everafters, a murderer. This
isn’t the city Sabrina so fondly remembers: the place where she spent happy, normal days with her family.
Even her memories of her parents aren’t safe. As the sisters Grimm investigate the death of an innocent
Everafter, they learn that their mother kept a secret from them that might lead to the heart of that evil
organization, the Scarlet Hand. Repackaged in paperback with new cover art, these anniversary editions of
the beloved Sisters Grimm series are the perfect opportunity for existing fans to revisit the adventures of the
Grimm family and for new readers to discover the magic of the series for the first time.

The Sisters Grimm: The Unusual Suspects

Once Upon a Crime (Sisters Grimm #4)
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